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Pricing as a team sport

P
ricing is often seen as 
the domain of the sales 
and marketing depart-
ments, yet this nar-
row view overlooks the 
broader organizational 
implications of pricing 

strategies. To achieve pricing excel-
lence, companies must recognize that 
pricing is a team sport, requiring col-
laboration across multiple functions. 
Pricing is the ultimate team sport. 
We are not talking doubles tennis or 
beach volleyball. We are talking sports 
like rugby or American football! This 
essay explores the reasons why de-
partments such as Human Resources 
(HR), Information Technology (IT), Fi-
nance, Supply Chain, Quality, Applica-
tion Engineering, and Manufacturing 
should actively participate in pricing 
transformational programs. I call these 
functions the unusual suspects! 

By adopting a truly collaborative ap-
proach, organizations can develop and 
execute more effective pricing strat-
egies. A culture of collaboration and 
alignment boosts competitive advan-
tage, and ultimately improves financial 
performance.

The Need for Cross-Functional 
Collaboration in Pricing
Effective pricing strategies are criti-
cal for any organization seeking to 
maximize profitability and sustain 
long-term growth. However, develop-
ing and implementing these strategies 
is not a task that can be siloed within 
a single department or within go-to-
market functions only. Instead, pricing 
must be approached as a collaborative 
effort that draws on the expertise and 
insights of various functions within the 
organization. There are adjacencies in 
pricing that cannot be ignored. For ex-
ample, the impact on finance and sup-
ply chain teams when pricing tactics 
are transformed must be quickly ad-
dressed.

The complexity of modern markets, 
characterized by rapid technological 
change, global competition, and shift-
ing customer expectations, necessi-
tates a holistic approach to pricing. 
This approach ensures that pricing de-
cisions are informed by a comprehen-
sive understanding of the entire value 
chain, from product development to 
customer experience. To achieve this 
level of integration, it is essential that 

departments such as HR, IT, Finance, 
Supply Chain, and Quality are active-
ly involved in the pricing process. The 
involvement cannot be last minute or 
when the projects are in rollout mode. 
These teams must be included from 
the original blueprinting and design 
phases. The sooner they are involved, 
the greater the probability of deploy-
ment success. Remember that 70% of 
projects fail to reach the desired out-
come according to scholars.

I want to take the time to go into each 
of these functions and show how stra-
tegic they can be in pricing transfor-
mation programs. For each function, 
I focus on three critical contributions. 
Again, the goal of this paper is to 
make sure no one is left behind in the 
design and execution of these pro-
grams. Let us get started.

The Role of Human Resources in 
Pricing Excellence
Human Resources plays a crucial role 
in supporting pricing excellence by 
ensuring that the organization has the 
right talent, skills, and culture to ex-
ecute pricing strategies effectively. 
Here are three reasons why HR should 
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be involved in pricing programs:

1. Talent Acquisition and Develop-
ment: HR is responsible for recruit-
ing and developing the permanent or 
temporary talent needed to drive pric-
ing initiatives. This includes identify-
ing individuals with strong analytical 
skills, commercial acumen, and an un-
derstanding of market dynamics. By 
aligning talent acquisition and devel-
opment with the organization’s pric-
ing goals, HR can ensure that the com-
pany has the capabilities required to 
compete effectively in the market-
place.

2. Training and Development: Pric-
ing excellence requires continuous 
learning and adaptation. Training and 
people development teams can fa-
cilitate this by designing and imple-
menting training programs that en-
hance employees’ understanding of 
pricing strategies, tools, and tech-
niques. These programs can help build 
a pricing-savvy workforce that is bet-
ter equipped to make informed pric-
ing decisions and respond to market 
changes.

3. Performance Management: HR can 
align performance management sys-
tems with pricing objectives by setting 

clear targets and incentives related to 
pricing outcomes. This ensures that 
employees across the organization are 
motivated to contribute to pricing ex-
cellence and that their efforts are rec-
ognized and rewarded.

I have also worked with HR teams on 
internal communications campaigns 
to support change management ef-
forts. In fact, when starting pricing 
programs, I often start with a meeting 
with the Chief People Officer or VP of 

HR. I exposed to her or him the stra-
tegic role that HR plays to move the 
culture and mindset towards value and 
pricing excellence.

The Role of Information 
Technology in Pricing Excellence
It goes without saying that Informa-
tion Technology is critical to the de-
velopment and execution of effec-
tive pricing strategies. IT provides 
the tools and infrastructure needed 
to collect, analyze, and act on pricing 
data. The IT infrastructure is extreme-
ly relevant when it comes to reducing 
complexity and building the techno-
logical backbone of the pricing pro-
grams. Here are three reasons why 
IT should be involved in pricing pro-
grams:

1. Data Integration and Management: 
Pricing decisions are increasingly driv-
en by data. IT plays a vital role in in-
tegrating data from various sources, 
including sales, customer interactions, 
market research, and supply chain op-
erations. By providing a unified view 
of this data (in CRM, ERP, marketing 
automation, etc.), IT enables the orga-
nization to make more informed pric-
ing decisions based on a comprehen-
sive understanding of dynamic market 
conditions.

2. Pricing Analytics and Tools: Ad-
vanced pricing strategies require so-
phisticated analytics tools that can 
model different pricing scenarios, 
forecast demand, and assess the im-
pact of pricing decisions. IT is respon-
sible for selecting, implementing, and 
maintaining these tools, ensuring that 
they are accessible to the relevant 
stakeholders and that they provide ac-
curate and actionable insights.

3. Automation and Efficiency: IT can 

help streamline pricing processes 
through automation. This includes au-
tomating routine pricing tasks, such as 
updating price lists, processing dis-
counts, and managing promotions. By 
reducing manual effort and minimiz-
ing the risk of errors, IT can improve 
the efficiency and accuracy of pricing 
operations.

Some organizations are blessed with 
dedicated IT pricing teams. That is the 
exception rather than the rule. How-
ever, when a company operates with 
a pricing optimization software plat-
form, a pricing billing system, an ERP, 
and a CRM, the level of pricing special-
ization that is required can be high.

The Role of Finance in Pricing 
Excellence
Finance is integral to pricing excel-
lence, as it ensures that pricing deci-
sions align with the organization’s fi-
nancial goals and contribute to overall 
profitability. Here are three reasons 
why Finance should be involved in 
pricing programs:

1. Profitability Analysis: Finance pro-
vides the analytical tools and frame-
works needed to assess the profitabil-
ity of different pricing strategies. This 
includes analyzing cost structures, 
margin impacts, and the financial im-
plications of various pricing scenari-
os. By doing so, Finance ensures that 
pricing decisions support the organi-
zation’s financial objectives.

2. Cost Management: Effective pricing 
strategies require a deep understand-
ing of the underlying costs associated 
with producing and delivering prod-
ucts or services. Finance is responsi-
ble for tracking and managing these 
costs. But also need to support cost-
to-serve analysis and customer profit-
ability tracking.

3. Risk Management: Pricing decisions 
can expose the organization to finan-
cial risks, such as price wars, regula-
tory challenges, or shifts in custom-
er demand. Finance is responsible for 
identifying and mitigating these risks 
through careful analysis and scenar-

A d v a n c e d  p r i c i n g  s t r a t e g i e s  r e q u i r e 
s o p h i s t i c a t e d  a n a l y t i c s  t o o l s  t h a t  c a n  m o d e l 
d i f f e r e n t  p r i c i n g  s c e n a r i o s ,  f o r e c a s t  d e m a n d , 
a n d  a s s e s s  t h e  i m p a c t  o f  p r i c i n g  d e c i s i o n s .  
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io planning. This proactive approach 
helps protect the organization’s finan-
cial stability.

I have involved finance teams in all my 
transformational programs. It is es-
sential to expose them to concepts of 
customer value and value-based pric-
ing. With their analytical skills and 
knowledge of tools, they become as-
sets in teamwork and working ses-
sions!

The Role of Supply Chain in 
Pricing Excellence
The Supply Chain function is frequent-
ly forgotten in pricing excellence pro-
grams. It is a mistake. This function 
directly influences the value percep-
tions, cost structure, lead times, and 
overall service efficiency of the orga-
nization. Here are three reasons why 
Supply Chain should be involved in 
pricing programs:

1. Lead Time and Availability: Pric-
ing strategies must consider product 
availability and lead times, which are 
managed by the Supply Chain func-
tion. Ensuring that products are avail-
able when and where customers want 
them can justify premium pricing and 
enhance customer satisfaction. Con-
versely, supply chain disruptions can 
necessitate price adjustments to man-
age demand.

2. Supplier Relationships: Strong re-
lationships with suppliers can provide 
leverage in negotiating better pric-
es for raw materials and components. 
These cost savings can be passed on 
to customers through competitive 
pricing or retained to improve mar-
gins. The Supply Chain team plays a 
key role in managing strategic suppli-
er relationships and securing capacity 
and quality levels.

3. Inventory Management: Effective 
inventory management is crucial to 
balancing supply and demand, avoid-
ing stockouts, and minimizing excess 
inventory. The Supply Chain team’s 
ability to manage inventory levels di-
rectly impacts pricing strategies, par-
ticularly in industries with perishable 

goods or rapidly changing demand.

Supply chain teams cannot be in-
volved in all pricing initiatives. They 
can be invited to a quarterly pricing 
council meeting for example to pay 
attention to customer KPIs as well as 
issues in service performance. They 
play a critical role in customer seg-
mentation programs when service 
conditions are customized for each 
segment.

The Role of Quality in Pricing 
Excellence
Quality management is integral to 
pricing excellence, as the perceived 
value of a product or service is closely 
tied to its quality. Here are three rea-
sons why Quality should be involved in 
pricing programs:

1. Customer Perception: Quality di-
rectly influences customer perception 
of value. Products and services that 
consistently meet or exceed quality 

standards can command higher prices. 
The Quality team’s role in maintaining 
and improving product quality is es-
sential to supporting premium pricing 
strategies.

2. Value Quantification: Profession-
als in quality management know a lot 
about the customer business. They 
also have access to performance data. 

They can become an asset in value 
quantification workshops bringing in 
the technical and operational voice of 
customers.

3. Cost of Quality: Poor quality can 
lead to increased costs due to returns, 
rework, and warranty claims. These 
costs must be factored into pricing 
decisions. By minimizing the cost of 
quality through effective quality man-
agement practices, the organization 
can set prices that reflect true value 
while protecting margins.

You will be surprised by the amount of 
customer and performance data that 
is available in the quality department. 
Quality folks know a lot and must be 
leveraged in pricing programs.

The Role of Manufacturing in 
Pricing Excellence
I never work on strategic programs 
without at least involving Plant Man-
agers. First, they usually are high-

ly qualified professionals with deep 
knowledge about the business. Sec-
ond, manufacturing is at the heart of 
product creation, and its operations 
directly influence cost structures and 
pricing strategies. Here are three rea-
sons why Manufacturing should be in-
volved in pricing programs:

1. Production Flexibility: The ability to 
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adjust production and to allocate ca-
pacity quickly in response to market 
demand is crucial for dynamic pricing 
strategies. Manufacturing’s role in en-
hancing production flexibility, through 
techniques such as lean manufactur-
ing or just-in-time production, enables 
the organization to respond to price 
changes and market conditions effec-
tively.

2. Scalability: Pricing strategies of-
ten depend on the organization’s abil-
ity to scale production up or down. 
Manufacturing ensures that the orga-
nization can meet large orders or pri-
oritize strategic customer orders with-
out compromising quality or incurring 
excessive costs. This scalability sup-
ports volume-based pricing strategies 
and can help the organization capture 
market share.

3. Product Quality and Consistency: 
Consistent product quality is a key de-
terminant of customer satisfaction and 
perceived value. Manufacturing’s role 
in maintaining high-quality standards 
ensures that products meet custom-
er expectations, justifying premium 
pricing and reducing the likelihood of 
price-related complaints or returns.

Believe it or not, Plant, Engineering, 
and Manufacturing Excellence Manag-
ers get it. They are focused on excel-
lence and continuous improvement. 
They also love numbers. I often involve 
them in segmentation projects, value 
quantification programs, and general 
training programs.

The Role of Application 
Engineering in Pricing Excellence
Application Engineering is critical in 
tailoring products and solutions to 
meet specific customer needs. This 
function plays a significant role in cre-
ating value that supports premium 
pricing. Here are five reasons why Ap-
plication Engineering should be in-
volved in pricing programs:

1. Customization and Differentiation: 
Application Engineering provides cus-
tomized solutions that address specif-
ic customer requirements, enhancing 
the perceived value of products. This 
customization allows the organization 
to differentiate its offerings and justify 
higher prices compared to standard-
ized products.

2. Technical Expertise: Applica-
tion Engineers possess deep techni-
cal knowledge that can be leveraged 
to communicate the value of complex 
products to customers. Their expertise 
helps in articulating the unique ben-
efits of a product, which can support 
value-based pricing strategies. They 
spend the lion share of their time at 
customers’ locations and on the pro-
duction line so to speak. They have 
deep knowledge and insight into the 
customer process, which can be useful 
in value quantification workshops.

3. Sales Enablement: Application En-
gineering supports the sales team by 
providing technical insights and solu-
tions that help close deals. Their in-
volvement ensures that the pricing re-
flects the true value delivered to the 

customer, particularly in industries 
where technical specifications play 
a significant role in purchasing deci-
sions.

Conclusion
Pricing excellence cannot be achieved 
in isolation; it requires the concerted 
effort of multiple functions across the 
organization. Pricing programs must 
involve much more than the usual sus-
pects: marketing, sales, innovation, 
product management, and pricing. 
Other functions have critical roles to 
play in developing and implementing 
effective pricing strategies. By leverag-
ing the unique expertise and insights of 
these functions, organizations can cre-
ate more holistic and dynamic pricing 
approaches. You will be amazed by the 
level of energy and motivation from all 
teams when they are allowed to partici-
pate in strategic value and pricing pro-
grams. Participation means listening to 
their voice, bringing their expertise into 
the process, and recognizing the val-
ue they bring to the pricing process. In 
today’s complex and rapidly changing 
market environment, treating pricing 
as a team sport is not just a best prac-
tice—it is a necessity. Organizations 
that embrace this collaborative and 
aligned approach will be better posi-
tioned to navigate the challenges of 
pricing and to capitalize on the oppor-
tunities that arise in the pursuit of pric-
ing excellence.

Pricing is a team sport. To win, you 
need a playbook and the best talent 
on the field! 


